
 

Dry Fertilizers 
 

  

Ammonium Sulfate: 21-00-00-24S 
 Applied ammonium sulfate primarily where they need supplemental N 

and S to meet the nutritional requirement of growing plants. 

Triple 15: 15-15-15-10S 
 Offers balanced NPK nutrition, in each homogeneous pellet. Triple 15 

offers high nutrient value, as well as 200 lbs. of sulfur in every ton. This 
product is ideal for orchard and row crop applications 

Triple 20 20-20-20 

 Supplements soil fertilization by supplying essential nutrients when 
plant food needs are highest such as at flowering and/or fruiting 
stages or in stress conditions.) It is recommended as a supplement to a 
conventional fertility program, potentially enhancing yield and/or 
quality. Avoid spraying during full bloom.  

Turf Supreme: 16-06-08 
 Our 16-06-08 fertilizer is blended to provide a slow releasing, water 

activated economical fertilizer.  Our 16-06-08 fertilizer is a great 
mixture for lawns, pastures, wildlife food plots, and just about 
everything that grows. 

Tree and Vine: 12-08-16-17S-3Fe-.5Mn 
 Used as topdressing, basal fertilizer as well as seedling fertilizer. 

Suitable for all types of soil and plants. Specifically designed for high 
value crops such as vegetables, fruit trees, vines and turf. Utilizes a 
balanced nitrogen source containing both ammonium and nitrate 
nitrogen, a combination of fully available phosphorus forms giving 
longer lasting availability of phosphorus over a wide range of soil 
types, and a choice of either chloride or sulfate as the potassium 
source. Contain secondary and micronutrients essential for specific 
crops. 

06-24-24 XB+: 06-24-24-5S-1.5Fe 
 An excellent formulation for use as a pre-plant fertilizer for turf, 

ornamentals, and vegetable gardens or to prepare turf and 
ornamentals for the stresses of winter. A beneficial supplement 
fertilizer for soils low in Phosphate and Potash. 
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Urea: 46-00-00 
 Urea contains the highest nitrogen percentage (46%) of all the solid 

fertilizers and is widely used as a nitrogen fertilizer for plants. 

K-Mag: 00-00-21-21S-11Mg 
 Supplies three vital plant nutrients — potassium, magnesium and 

sulfur. It is an excellent source of non-chloride potassium, water 
soluble magnesium and non-acidifying sulfur. An economical source of 
magnesium and sulfur often used in our custom bulk blend fertilizers. 

Mono-Ammonium 
Phosphate: 11-52-00 

 An excellent wide range, agronomic choice for all crops requiring 
nitrogen and phosphorus nutrition. 

Mono-Potassium 
Phosphate (MKP): 00-52-34 

 A highly efficient source of phosphorus and potassium for plants. A 
preferred source of phosphorus and potassium when nitrogen 
fertilization should be limited. Often used during early growing season, 
when phosphorus and potassium are needed at high rates for the 
establishment of root system. Application of MKP at the productive 
stages of sugar-rich fruit crops helps to increase sugar content and to 
improve the quality of these. 

Sulfate of Potash: 00-00-50 
 An excellent high-potassium, low-chloride fertilizer providing essential 

nutrients that help plants resist disease and pests, ensure a longer 
shelf life, and produce tastier and more attractive produce without the 
excess chloride that can harm crops. 

Muriate of Potash: 00-00-60 
 Enriched source of the mineral potassium for balanced leaf & root 

growth for vegetables, herbs, flowers, ornamentals. 

  

 

  


